§‘*’§ House of

Commons

30 OCTOBER 2024

Resolutions to be moved by
the Chancellor of the Exchequer




Correction

In resolution 16, paragraph (2), “IRR”
in inserted subsection (4)(a) and (b)
has been corrected to read “lIR”.



(2)

The Chancellor of the Exchequer

PROVISIONAL COLLECTION OF TAXES: That,
pursuant to section 5 of the Provisional
Collection of Taxes Act 1968, provisional
statutory effect shall be given to the following
motions:—
@ Value added tax (private school fees)
(motion no. 34);
® Stamp duty land tax (additional
dwellings: purchases before 1 April
2025) (motion no. 35);
© Stamp duty land tax (purchases by
companies) (motion no. 37);
@ Rates of tobacco products duty (motion
no. 406).



(3)

ARRANGEMENT OF WAYS AND MEANS
RESOLUTIONS

Income tax (charge)

Income tax (main rates)

Income tax (default and savings rates)
Income tax (starting rate limit for savings)
Income tax (appropriate percentage for cars)
Capital gains tax (the main rates)

Capital gains tax (business asset disposal

relief)

8- Capital gains tax (investors’ relief)

?- Capital gains tax (rates on carried interest
gains)

10-Corporation tax (charge and main rate for

financial year 2026)

-.Corporation tax (standard small profits rate
and fraction for financial year 2026)

2 Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (increase in
rate)

B-Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (relief for
investment expenditure)

“4-Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (period for
which levy has effect)

15-Qil and gas (decommissioning of carbon
storage installations)

e Pillar Two (Pillar Two territories etc)
17-Pillar Two (UTPR etc)

18- Offshore receipts in respect of intangible
property

N o ok o=



(4)

- Application of PAYE in relation to
internationally mobile employees

2- Advance pricing agreements
21 First-year allowances (electric vehicles)

22.Commercial letting of furnished holiday
accommodation

2 Expenditure on visual effects in films and
television programmes

2+ Relief for films, television programmes and
video games (certification etc)

> Research and development

- Employee-ownership trusts (requirements as
to trustees etc)

- Employee-ownership trusts (claims and
reliefs)

*-Pensions (overseas transfer charge)

»-Pensions (schemes established or
administered in EEA states)

%- Alternative finance arrangements (capital
gains tax etc)

31 Statutory neonatal care pay

2.Persons not domiciled in United Kingdom

> Minor amendments relating to trusts

% Value added tax (private school fees)

% Stamp duty land tax (additional dwellings:
purchases before 1 April 2025)

- Stamp duty land tax (additional dwellings:
purchases on or after 1 April 2025)

7. Stamp duty land tax (purchases by
companies)



(5)

% Annual tax on enveloped dwellings (alternative
finance arrangements)

¥-Stamp taxes (testing of financial market
infrastructure technologies or practices)

- Inheritance tax (nil rate band etc for tax years
2028-29 and 2029-30)

-Inheritance tax (employee benefit trusts)

2 Inheritance tax (agricultural land subject to
environmental management agreement)

#-Inheritance tax (statements about national
savings accounts)

# Rates of alcohol duty

- Abolition of duty stamps for alcoholic products
- Rates of tobacco products duty

7. Rates of vehicle excise duty

%-Vehicle excise duty (zero-emission vehicles
etc)

* Rates of HGV road user levy

*0-Rates of air passenger duty (current and
future years)

°l-Rates of climate change levy (future years)
>z Rates of landfill tax

> Rate of aggregates levy

>+ Rate of plastic packaging tax

> Rates of soft drinks industry levy

°¢- Avoidance involving limited liability
partnerships

”-Loans to participators
*-OECD crypto-asset reporting framework
*>Vaping products (preparing for new tax)



(6)

%-Carbon border adjustment mechanism
(preparing for new tax etc)

¢1-Correction of wrong cross-reference etc
52 Incidental provision etc



(7)

1. Income tax (charge)

That income tax is charged for the tax year
2025-26.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

2. Income tax (main rates)

That for the tax year 2025-26 the main rates
of income tax are as follows—

(a) the basic rate is 20%,
(b) the higher rate is 40%, and
(c) the additional rate is 45%.
And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have

statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

3. Income tax (default and savings rates)
That—

(1) For the tax year 2025-26 the default rates
of income tax are as follows—

(a) the default basic rate is 20%,
(b) the default higher rate is 40%, and
(c) the default additional rate is 45%.

(2) For the tax year 2025-26 the savings rates
of income tax are as follows—

(a) the savings basic rate is 20%,



(8)

(b) the savings higher rate is 40%, and
(c) the savings additional rate is 45%.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

4. Income tax (starting rate limit for savings)
That—

(1) For the tax year 2025-26 the amount
specified in section 12(3) of the Income Tax

Act 2007 (the starting rate limit for savings)
is “£5,000”.

(2) Accordingly, section 21 of that Act
(indexation) does not apply in relation to
the starting rate limit for savings for that tax
year.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

5. Income tax (appropriate percentage for cars)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made taking effect in a future
year increasing the appropriate percentages



(9)

mentioned in sections 139 to 142 of the Income
Tax (Earnings and Pensions) Act 2003.

6.
That—

Capital gains tax (the main rates)

(1) In section 1H of the Taxation of Chargeable
Gains Act 1992 (the main rates of CGT)—

(@)

(b)

(f)

omit subsection (1A) (which sets out
the rates for residential property gains
accruing to individuals),

in subsection (3) (which sets out the
rates for gains accruing to individuals
that are not residential property gains
or carried interest gains)—

(i) for “10%” substitute “18%”, and
(ii) for “20%” substitute “24%",

omit subsection (4A) (which sets out
the rates for residential property gains
accruing to personal representatives),
in subsection (6) (which sets out the
rates for gains accruing to personal
representatives that are not residential
property gains or carried interest gains),
for “20%" substitute “24%”7,

omit subsection (7) (which sets out the
rates for residential property gains
accruing to trustees), and

in subsection (8) (which sets out the
rates for gains accruing to trustees that


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/1H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/1H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/1H

(2)

(3)

(4)

(5)

(10)

are not residential property gains or
carried interest gains)—

(i) omit “Other”, and

(ii) for “20%” substitute “24%".

The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to disposals made
on or after 30 October 2024.

If an asset is transferred on or after 30
October 2024 under an unconditional
contract made before that date, the disposal
IS, despite section 28(1) of the Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992, to be treated
for the purposes of the amendments made
by this Resolution as taking place at the
time the asset is transferred (rather than at
the time the contract is made) unless the
contract is an excluded contract.

A contract is an excluded contract if—

(a) obtaining an advantage by reason of
the application of section 28(1) of the
Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992
was no purpose of entering into the
contract, and

(b) where the parties to the contract are
connected persons, the contract was
entered into wholly for commercial
reasons.

A contract is not to be regarded as an
excluded contract unless the person making



(6)

(8)

(11)

the transfer makes a claim which includes
a statement that the contract meets the
conditions to be an excluded contract.

But no claim is required if the total amount

of—

(a) the chargeable gain accruing on the
disposal, and

(b) the chargeable gains accruing on all
other disposals made under excluded
contracts,

does not exceed £100,000.

For this purpose the amount of any gain
accruing on a qualifying business disposal
is to be taken to be the amount of the gain
under section 169N(2) of the Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992.

If the person making the transfer makes—

(a) a claim under section 169M of the
Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992
in relation to a qualifying business
disposal (business asset disposal
relief), or

(b) a claim under section 169VM of that
Act (investors’ relief) in relation to a
disposal,

section 169M(2) and (3) of that Act, or (as

the case may be) section 169VM(1) and

(2) of that Act, apply to a claim under

paragraph (5) in relation to the disposal as



(12)

they apply to a claim under the section
concerned.

(9) In this Resolution “qualifying business
disposal” has the meaning given by Chapter
3 of Part 5 of the Taxation of Chargeable
Gains Act 1992.

(10) In this Resolution any reference to the
transfer of an asset includes its
conveyance.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

7. Capital gains tax (business asset disposal
relief)

That provision may be made increasing the
rate specified in section 169N(3) of the Taxation
of Chargeable Gains Act 1992, including
(notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the
practice of the House relating to the matters
that may be included in Finance Bills) provision
taking effect in a future year.

8. Capital gains tax (investors’ relief)

That—

(a) provision may be made increasing the
rate specified in section 169VC(2) of
the Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act
1992, including (notwithstanding



(13)

anything to the contrary in the practice
of the House relating to the matters that
may be included in Finance Bills)
provision taking effect in a future year,
and

(b) provision may be made reducing the
amount specified in sections 169VK(1)
and (2) and 169VL(2) and (3) of that
Act.

9. Capital gains tax (rates on carried interest
gains)
That provision may be made increasing the

rates at which carried interest gains are charged
to capital gains tax.

10. Corporation tax (charge and main rate for
financial year 2026)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made—

(a) for corporation tax to be charged for
the financial year 2026, and

(b) for the main rate of corporation tax for
that year to be 25%.

11. Corporation tax (standard small profits rate
and fraction for financial year 2026)



(14)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made—

(a) for the standard small profits rate to be
19% for the purposes of Part 3A of the
Corporation Tax Act 2010 for the
financial year 2026, and

(b) for the standard marginal relief fraction
to be 3/200ths for those purposes for
that year.

12. Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (increase
in rate)

That—

(1) In section 1 of the Energy (Oil and Gas)
Profits Levy Act 2022 (charge to tax), in
subsection (1), for “35%” substitute “38%".

(2) The amendment made by paragraph (1)
has effect for accounting periods beginning
on or after 1 November 2024.

(3) In the case of an accounting period (a
“straddling period”) beginning before 1
November 2024 and ending on or after that
date—

(a) the Energy (Oil and Gas) Profits Levy
Act 2022 is to apply as if so much of
the straddling period as falls before that
date, and so much of the straddling


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/1
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/1
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents

(15)

period as falls on or after that date,
were separate accounting periods, and

(b) the company’s levy profits or loss
determined for the straddling period (on
the assumption that the whole of that
period were a qualifying period) are
apportioned to the two separate
accounting periods in accordance with
section 17 of that Act, which is to apply
for the purposes of this Resolution as
it applies for the purposes of sections
15 and 16 of that Act.

(4) In the case of a straddling period, the
Instalment Payments Regulations 1998 are
to apply separately—

(a) in relation to the levy, and

(b) in relation to any other tax chargeable
on the company.

(5) In their application as a result of paragraph
(4)(a), the Instalment Payments Regulations
1998 are to have effect in relation to the
levy—

(a) as if the two separate accounting
periods deemed to arise under
paragraph (3)(a) were accounting
periods for the purposes of those
Regulations and as if the levy were
chargeable for those deemed
accounting periods, but


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/17
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/15
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/15
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/16
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents

(b)

(6) Any

(16)

as if the final instalment payment for
the deemed accounting period ending
on 31 October 2024 became due and
payable on the date on which the next
instalment payment after 31 October
2024 would have become due and
payable for the straddling period in the
absence of this Resolution.

reference in the Instalment Payments

Regulations 1998 to the total liability of a
company is accordingly to be read—

(@)

(b)

(7) For

in their application as a result of
paragraph (4)(a), as a reference to the
levy, and

in their application as a result of
paragraph (4)(b), as a reference to the
amount that would be the company’s
total liability for the straddling period if
the levy were left out of account.

the purposes of the Instalment

Payments Regulations 1998—

(@)

a company is to be regarded as a large
company as respects the deemed
accounting periods under paragraph
(3)(a) only if it is a large company for
those purposes as respects the
straddling period, and

any question whether a company is a
large company as respects the
straddling period is to be determined



(17)

as it would have been determined apart
from section 1 of the Energy (Oil and
Gas) Profits Levy Act 2022.

(8) In this Resolution “the Instalment Payment
Regulations 1998” means the Corporation
Tax (Instalment Payments) Regulations
1998 (S.l. 1998/3175).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

13. Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (relief for
investment expenditure)

That—

(1) The Energy (Oil and Gas) Profits Levy Act
2022 is amended as follows.

(2) For section 2 substitute—

“2 Additional expenditure treated as
incurred for purposes of section 1

(1) This section applies for the purposes
of section 1 if, in a qualifying
accounting period, a company has
incurred investment expenditure.

(2) Expenditure is “investment expenditure”
of a company so far as the
expenditure—


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/1
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/1998/3175/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/1998/3175/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/1998/3175/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/2

(3)

(4)

(18)

(a) is capital expenditure on the
de-carbonisation of its upstream
petroleum production,

(b) is incurred for the purposes of
oil-related activities,

(c) is not incurred for disqualifying
purposes, and

(d) does not consist of financing costs
or decommissioning costs.

For the purposes of section 1 the
company is to be treated as if, in
addition to the investment expenditure
incurred by it in the accounting period,
it had incurred in that period
expenditure of an amount equal to 66%
of the amount of that investment
expenditure.

For the purposes of this section—

(a) if investment expenditure is
incurred partly for the purposes of
oil-related activities and partly for
other purposes, the expenditure is
to be attributed to the oil-related
activities on a just and reasonable
basis, and

(b) if a company incurs expenditure
part of which is capital expenditure
on the de-carbonisation of its
upstream petroleum production and
part of which is not, the



(3)

(4)

(6)

(19)

expenditure is to be apportioned
on a just and reasonable basis.

(5) This section needs to be read with
section 6 (which prevents recycling etc
of assets to generate relief).”

Omit sections 3 and 4 (definitions of
“‘operating expenditure” and “leasing
expenditure”).

In section 7(1) (when investment

expenditure is incurred)—

(a) in paragraph (a), omit “in the case of
capital expenditure,”, and

(b) omit paragraph (b).

In section 18(1) (interpretation), omit the
definitions of “leasing expenditure” and
“‘operating expenditure”.

The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to expenditure
incurred on or after 1 November 2024 (and
section 7 of the Energy (Oil and Gas)
Profits Levy Act 2022 applies for the
purposes of this Resolution as it applies for
the purposes of that Act).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/3
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/4
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/7
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/7
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/7
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/7
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/18
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2022/40/section/18

(20)

statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

14. Energy (oil and gas) profits levy (period for
which levy has effect)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made for extending the period
for which the ener%ﬁ/ (oil and gas) profits levy
has effect until 31 March 2030.

15. Oil and gas (decommissioning of carbon
storage installations)

That provision may be made for relief to be
given in the case of payments made into a
decommissioning fund In accordance with
provision made under Chapter 2 of Part 2 of
the Energy Act 2023 (decommissioning of
carbon storage installations).

16. Pillar Two (Pillar Two territories etc)
That—

(1) The Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 is amended
as follows.

(2) In section 241 (Pillar Two territories) at the
end insert—

“(4) A territory outside the United Kingdom
is to be treated as a Pillar Two territory
for the purposes of any accounting



(21)

period that concluded before the first
regulations under this section have
been made if it is a territory in which a
tax applies for that accounting period—

(a) that is a Qualified [IR for the
purposes of the Pillar Two rules,
or

(b) that it is reasonable to conclude is
likely to be a Qualified IIR for the
purposes of those rules.”

(3) In section 256 (qualifying domestic top-up
tax) at the end insert—

“(5) A tax (other than domestic top-up tax
which is always a qualifying domestic
top-up tax) is to be treated as a
qualifying domestic top-up tax for the
purposes of any accounting period that
concluded before the first regulations
under this section have been made if—
(a) itis a Qualified Domestic Minimum
Top-up Tax for that accounting
period for the purposes of the Pillar
Two rules, or

(b) it is reasonable to conclude that it
is likely to be a Qualified Domestic
Minimum Top-up Tax for that
accounting period for the purposes
of those rules.”

(4) In Schedule 16A (qualifying domestic top-up
tax safe harbour election)—



(22)

(a) in paragraph 1(3), in the words before
paragraph (a), for “may only be made”
substitute “is only valid”, and

(b) in paragraph 2—

(i) the existing text becomes

(ii)

sub-paragraph (1), and
after that sub-paragraph insert—

“(2) A qualifying domestic top-up tax is

(3)

to be treated as accredited for the
purposes of any accounting period
that concluded before the first
regulations under this paragraph
have been made if—

(a) the tax falls within Chapter 5.5
to 5.7 of the QDMTT safe
harbour guidance, or

(b) it is reasonable to conclude that
the tax is likely to fall within
Chapter 5.5 to 5.7 of that
guidance.

For the purposes of sub-paragraph
(2) the “QDMTT safe harbour
guidance” means Chapter 5 of Tax
Challenges Arising from the
Digitalisation of the Economy -
Administrative Guidance on the
Global Anti-Base Erosion Model
Rules (Pillar Two), July 2023,
published by the OECD on 17 July
2023



(23)

(5) The amendments made by this Resolution
come into force on 7 November 2024.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

17. Pillar Two (UTPR etc)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made—

(@)

(b)

(c)

for the purpose of implementing the
UTPR within the meaning of the Pillar
Two rules,

for the purpose of ensuring that
changes (or anticipated changes) to
those rules are taken into account in
the provision made by Parts 3 and 4 of
the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 and
otherwise in connection with the
application of those rules, and

about the exclusion from Part 4 of that
Act of certain entities which are not
members of a multinational group.

18. Offshore receipts in respect of intangible

property



(24)

That provision may be made repealing Chapter
2A of Part 5 of the Income Tax (Trading and
Other Income) Act 2005.

19. Application of PAYE in relation to
internationally mobile employees

That provision may be made for replacing
section 690 of the Income Tax (Earnings and
Pensions) Act 2003 in cases where employees
are internationally mobile.

20. Advance pricing agreements

That provision (mcludlng provision having
retrospective effect) g be made for the
purposes of sectlon 219(2) of the Taxation
(International and Other Provisions) Act 2010.

21. First-year allowances (electric vehicles)

That provision may be made extending the
date by which expenditure must be incurred to
qualify for an allowance under section 45D or
45EA of the Capital Allowances Act 2001.

22. Commercial letting of furnished holiday
accommodation

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made abolishing



(25)

the special rules relating to the commercial
letting of furnished holiday accommodation.

23. Expenditure on visual effects in films and
television programmes

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made amending Part 14A of
the Corporation Tax Act 2009 so as to provide
for the payment of credits to companies in
respect of expenditure incurred on the use of
computer technology to create or alter images
for inclusion in a film or television programme.

24. Relief for films, television programmes and
video games (certification etc)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made amending Part 14A of
the Corporation Tax Act 2009 in relation to—

(a) the certification of films, television

programmes and video games, and

(b) the treatment of expenditure that is not
paid within a specified period after the
end of an accounting period.

25. Research and development

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)



(26)

provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made—
(a) about the application of Chapter 2 of
Part 13 of the Corporation Tax Act
2009 in relation to Northern lIreland,
and
(b) substituting a new sub-paragraph (4)
for paragraph 21(4) of Schedule 1 to
the Finance Act 2024.

26. Employee-ownership trusts (requirements
as to trustees etc)

That—

Introduction

(1) The Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992
iIs amended as follows.

Requirement for trustees of
employee-ownership trusts to be UK resident

(2) In  section 236H(4) (disposals to
employee-ownership trusts), before
paragraph (a) insert—

“(aa) that the trustees of the settlement
are resident in the United
Kingdom at the time of the
disposal and continue to be UK
resident for the remainder of the
tax year in which that time falls,”.


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H

(27)

(3) In section 2360(2) (no section 236H relief
if disqualifying event in next tax year),
before paragraph (a) insert—

“(aa)the trustees of the settlement
cease to be resident in the United
Kingdom,”.

(4) In section 236P (events which trigger
deemed disposal and reacquisition by
trustees), after subsection (3) insert—

“(3A) See also section 80 (trustees ceasing
to be resident in UK), which provides
for similar consequences in
circumstances where the trustees of
the settlement cease to be resident in
the United Kingdom.”

(5) In section 236Q(1)(c) (relief for deemed
disposals under section 71), for
“236H(4)(a)” substitute “236H(4)(aa)”.

Trustee independence

(6) In section 236H(4), after paragraph (b)
insert—

“(ba) that the settlement meets the
trustee independence requirement
(see section 236LA) at the time
of the disposal and continues to
meet that requirement for the
remainder of the tax year in which
that time falls,”.


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H

(28)

(7) After section 236L insert—

“236LA Trustee independence
requirement

(1) A settlement meets the trustee
independence requirement if—

(a) less than 50% of the trustees are

(2)

(3)

persons who are excluded
participators, and

(b) excluded participators do not have

control of the settlement.

In this section “excluded participator”
means—

(a)

(b)

a person that is an excluded
participator within the meaning
given by section 236J, other than
a person who is an excluded
participator only as a result of a
connection falling within section
286(3) (trustees regarded as
connected with settlors etc), or

a company not falling within
paragraph (a), if 50% or more of
its directors are persons falling
within that paragraph.

Excluded participators have control of
the settlement if one or more excluded
participators, acting alone or together
without the trustees who are not
excluded participators, have power


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236L

(29)

under the trust instrument or by law

to—

(a) dispose of, advance, lend, invest,
pay or apply settlement property;

(b) vary or terminate the settlement;

(c) add or remove a person as a
beneficiary or to or from a class of
beneficiaries;

(d) appoint or remove trustees or give
another individual control over the
settlement;

(e) direct the exercise of a power
mentioned in sub-paragraphs (a)
to (d).”

(8) In section 2360(2), after paragraph (b)
insert—

“(ba) the settlement ceases to meet the
trustee independence
requirement,”.

(9) In section 236P(2) (events which trigger
deemed disposal and reacquisition by
trustees), after paragraph (b) insert—

“(ba) the settlement ceases to meet the
trustee independence
requirement,”.


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P

(30)

Temporary breach of trustee independence
requirement or residence requirement arising
from death of trustee

(10) In section 2360, after subsection (2)
iInsert—

“(2A) Where—

(a) a disqualifying event falling within
subsection (2)(aa) occurs (trustees
cease to be resident in the United
Kingdom),

(b) the event only occurs as a result
of the death of a trustee of the
settlement, and

(c) within the period of 6 months
beginning with the death of the
trustee, the trustees become
resident in the United Kingdom,

the disqualifying event is to be ignored.

(2B) Where—

(a) a disqualifying event falling within
subsection (2)(ba) occurs (trustee
independence requirement ceases
to be met),

(b) the event only occurs as a result
of—

(i) the death of a trustee of the
settlement, or

(i) the death of a director of a
company that is a trustee of
the settlement, and


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O

(31)

(c) within the period of 6 months
beginning with that death, the
settlement meets the trustee
independence requirement,

the disqualifying event is to be

ignored.”

(11) In section 236P, after subsection (2)
insert—

“(2A) Where—

(a) a disqualifying event falling within
subsection (2)(ba) occurs (trustee
independence requirement ceases
to be met),

(b) the event only occurs as a result
of—

(i) the death of a trustee of the
settlement, or

(i) the death of a director of a
company that is a trustee of
the settlement, and

(c) within the period of 6 months
beginning with that death, the
settlement meets the trustee
iIndependence requirement,

the disqualifying event is to be

ignored.”

Consideration requirement

(12) In section 236H(4), after paragraph (c)
insert—


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H

(32)

“(ca) that the trustees have taken all
reasonable steps to secure that—

(i) the consideration for the
disposal does not exceed the
market value of the ordinary
share capital at the time of
the disposal, and

(i) where some or all of the
consideration for the disposal
is deferred, that the rate of
any interest payable in
relation to the deferral does
not exceed a reasonable
commercial rate,”.

(13) In section 236Q, in subsection (1)(c), for
“(d)” substitute “(c) and (d)".

Extended period for disqualifying events

(14) In section 2360—
(a) in the heading, for “tax year” substitute
“four tax years”, and

(b) in subsection (1)(b), for “the tax year”
substitute “any of the first four tax
years”.

(15) In section 236P(1), after “end of the” insert
“fourth”.

(16) In section 236R—

(a) in the heading, for “tax year” substitute
“four tax years”, and


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236O
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236P
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236R

(b)

(33)

in subsection (1)(b), for “the tax year”
substitute “any of the first four tax
years”.

Commencement

(17) The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to disposals made
on or after 30 October 2024.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

27. Employee-ownership trusts (claims and

reliefs)

That provision may be made—

(@)

(b)

about the information to be included in
claims under sections 236H and 236Q
of the Taxation of Chargeable Gains
Act 1992,

for relief for bonus payments under
Chapter 10A of Part 4 of the Income
Tax (Earnings and Pensions) Act 2003
not to be precluded by the exclusion of
directors from the scheme under which
the payments are awarded, and

for a relief from income tax on
distributions made to trustees of an
employee-ownership trust by the
company to which the trust relates to


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236R
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236R
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236H
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/1992/12/section/236Q

(34)

meet the costs of the trust acquiring
ordinary share capital of the company.

28. Pensions (overseas transfer charge)

That—

(1)

(2)

(3)

(4)

In Part 4 of the Finance Act 2004
(pensions), omit section 244C (exclusion
from overseas transfer charge where
receiving scheme in EEA state or Gibraltar,
and member resident in UK or EEA state).

Paragraphs (3) to (5) contain amendments
consequential on the repeal made by
paragraph (1).

In Part 4 of the Finance Act 2004—

(a) in section 244J (persons liable to
charge), in subsection (4), omit “or
244C”, and

(b) in section 244K (meaning of
“transferred value”), in subsection (6),
omit “or 244C”".

In the Pension Schemes (Information
Requirements for Qualifying Overseas
Pension Schemes, Qualifying Recognised
Overseas Pension Schemes  and
Corresponding Relief) Regulations 2006
(S.l. 2006/208)—
(@) in regulation 3 (information to be
provided to QROPS) in paragraph
(2C)—


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2004/12/part/4
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2004/12/part/4

(5)

(35)

(i) for “neither” substitute “not”, and
(i) omit paragraph (b) and the “nor”
before it,

(b) in regulation 3AF (information provided
by member to QROPS: inward and
outward transfers), in paragraph
(1)(b)(ii), omit “or 244C",

(c) in regulation 3AG (provision of
information about liability for overseas
transfer charge), in paragraph (2)(d),
omit “or 244C”, and

(d) in regulation 3AH (accounting for
overseas transfer charge where change
of circumstances), in paragraph
(1)(a)(ii), omit “or 244C(3)".

In the Registered Pension Schemes
(Provision of Information) Regulations 2006
(S.l. 2006/567)—

(@) in regulation 11BB (information
provided by members to scheme
administrators), in paragraph (1)(b)(ii),
omit “or 244C”, and

(b) in regulation 12A (information provided
by scheme administrators to members),
in paragraph (2)(d), omit “or 244C".

Subject to paragraphs (7) and (8), the
amendments made by this Resolution have
effect in relation to transfers made on or
after 30 October 2024.


https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2006/567/contents
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2006/567/contents

(7)

(8)

(36)

The amendments do not have effect in
relation to a transfer that is made—

(a) in execution of a request made before
30 October 2024, and

(b) before 30 April 2025.

Where—

(a) the repeal made by paragraph (1) does
not have effect in relation to a transfer,
but

(b) the tax consequences of that transfer
depend on the tax consequences of a
later transfer in relation to which the
repeal does have effect,

the tax consequences of the earlier transfer

are to be determined as if the repeal did

not have effect in relation to the later

transfer.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

29. Pensions (schemes established or
administered in EEA states)

That provision may be made about pension
schemes established in, or administered by
persons resident in, EEA states, including
(notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the
practice of the House relating to the matters



(37)

that may be included in Finance Bills) provision
taking effect in a future year.

30. Alternative finance arrangements (capital
gains tax etc)

That provision may be made for the purposes
of capital gains tax, income tax and corporation
tax in relation to alternative finance
arrangements where the customer has a
beneficial interest in an asset and disposes of
some or all of that interest to the financier.

31. Statutory neonatal care pay

That provision may be made in relation to
statutory neonatal care pay.

32. Persons not domiciled in United Kingdom

That provision may be made for the purposes
of income tax, capital gains tax and inheritance
tax for replacmg rules which operate by
reference to the place where a person is
domiciled with rules which operate by reference
to where a person is (or is not) resident during
a specified period, including—

(a) provision for a new temporary tax to be
chargeable on amounts designated by
persons who have been subject to the
remittance basis as a result of being
domiciled outside the United Kingdom,
and



(b)

(38)

provision amending the application of

the replaced rules in cases where they
continue to have effect.

33. Minor amendments relating to trusts
That provision may be made—

(@)

(b)

(d)

amending sections 645 and 646 of the
Income Tax (Trading and Other
Income) Act 2005 (settlements),
amending Chapter 2 of Part 13 of the
Income Tax Act 2007 in relation to
sections 721 and 728 of that Act and
repealing section 742A of that Act
(transfer of assets abroad),

repealing section 1E(4) of the Taxation
of Chargeable Gains Act 1992 and
amending section 87G of, and
paragraph 6 of Schedule 5 to, that Act
(provisions relating to trusts), and
amending sections 80(1) and 81(1) of
the Inheritance Tax Act
1984 (provisions relating to trusts).

34. Value added tax (private school fees)

That—

(1) The Value Added Tax Act 1994 is amended
in accordance with paragraphs (2) to (5).

(2) In Schedule 9 (exemptions)—
(a) in Group 6 (education)—



(39)

(i) initem 3(b)(i), after “5A” insert “(or
would be so exempt but for item 1
or 2 of Part 3)”, and

(i) in item 4, after “item 1" insert
“(whether or not that supply also
falls within item 1 or 2 of Part 3)”,

and
(b) after Part 2 (the groups) insert—
“PART 3
EXCEPTIONS
Item No.

1  The provision of education by a
private school, other than—
(a) the provision of the teaching of
English as a foreign language,
(b) the provision of education in a
nursery class, or
(c) the provision of a higher
education course.
2 The provision of vocational training
by a private school.
3  The provision of board and lodging
which is closely related to a supply
of a description falling within item 1
or 2.

Notes:

(1) A “private school” means an institution
which is either—



(40)

(a) a school—

(i)

(ii)

(iii)

at which full-time education is
provided for pupils of
compulsory school age or, in
Scotland, school age (whether
or not such education is also
provided for pupils under or
over that age),

where fees or other
consideration are payable for
that provision of full-term
education, and

which is not a nursery school,
or

(b) an institution—

(i)

which is wholly or mainly
concerned with  providing
education suitable to the
requirements of persons over
compulsory school age (or, in
Scotland, school age) but
under 19,

at which full-time education is
provided for such persons,
where the provision of full-time
education falling within
sub-paragraph (ii) is wholly or
mainly provision in respect of
which fees or other
consideration are payable, and



(2)

(3)

(4)

(41)

(iv) which is not an independent
training or learning provider.

In Note (1)(b) an “independent training

or learning provider” means an

institution—

(a) at which education or training is
provided for persons over
compulsory school age (or, in
Scotland, school age) but under 19
under a contract with a relevant
contracting authority, and

(b) where the consideration for the
provision falling within paragraph
(a) is payable by the relevant
contracting authority under that
contract.

For the purposes of Note (2), a

“relevant contracting authority” means

the Secretary of State, Medr

(Commission for Tertiary Education and

Research), the Department for the

Economy in Northern Ireland or Skills

Development Scotland.

For the purposes of items 1 and 2, the

provision of education or vocational

training at a private school by any
eligible body other than a private school

is to be treated as provision by a

private school if—

(a) the eligible body and that private
school are connected within the



(42)

meaning of section 1122 of the

Corporation Tax Act 2010

(connected persons), or

(b) the provision by the eligible body
is a result of arrangements the
main purpose, or one of the main
purposes, of which is to secure that
the provision is an exempt supply.

(5) For the purposes of Note (4)—

(a) “arrangements” include any
agreement, understanding,
scheme, transaction or series of
transactions (whether or not legally
enforceable), and

(b) an “eligible body” has the meaning
given by Note (1) to Group 6.

(6) For the purposes of item 1—

(a) a “nursery class” means a class
that is composed wholly (or almost
wholly) of children who—

(i) are under compulsory school
age or, in Scotland, school
age, and

(i) would not be expected to attain
that age while in that class,
and

(b) a “higher education course™—

(i) in relation to England and
Wales, has the meaning given
by section 83(1) of the Higher



(43)

Education and Research Act
2017;

(i) in relation to Scotland, means
a course of any description
mentioned in section 5(3) of
the Further and Higher
Education (Scotland) Act 2005;

(iii) in relation to Northern Ireland,
means a course of any
description  mentioned In
paragraph 1 of Schedule 1 to
the Further Education
(Northern Ireland) Order 1997
(S.1. 1997/1772 (N.I. 15)).

(7) For the purposes of item 2 “vocational
training” has the meaning given by
Note (3) to Group 6.

(8) In these Notes, “compulsory school
age”, “pupil”’, “school” and “school age”
have the meanings given by the
Education Act 1996, the Education
(Scotland) Act 1980 and the Education
and Libraries (Northern Ireland) Order
1986 (S.I. 1986/594 (N.I. 3)) in relation
to England and Wales, Scotland and
Northern Ireland respectively.”

(3) In section 31 (exempt supplies), in
subsection (1), for “Schedule 9" substitute
“Part 2 of Schedule 9 and it is not of a



(4)

(7)

(44)

description specified in Part 3 of that
Schedule”.

In section 8 (reverse charge on supplies
received from abroad), in subsection (4A),
for “Schedule 9" substitute “Part 2 of
Schedule 9 and not specified in Part 3 of
that Schedule”.

In section 43 (groups of companies), in

subsection (2A)—

(a) in paragraph (b), for “Schedule 9’
substitute “Part 2 of Schedule 9 or are
within any of the descriptions specified
in Part 3 of that Schedule”, and

(b) in paragraph (c), for “Schedule 9”
substitute “Part 2 of Schedule 9 or
which do fall within any of the
descriptions specified in Part 3 of that
Schedule”.

Paragraph (7) applies to the provision of
education services during a school term if
a payment in respect of the services was
received by the person providing the
services on or after 29 July 2024 and
before 30 October 2024.

That provision is treated for the purposes
of the charge to VAT as a supply taking
place on the later of—

(a) 1 January 2025, and

(b) the first day of that term.



(8)

(9)

(10)

(1)

(45)

Accordingly, that provision is not to be
regarded (as a result of provision made by

or under the Value Added Tax Act 1994)
as a supply taking place at any other time.

But paragraph (7) does not apply to the
provision of education services by a school
if the school is approved under section 342
of the Education Act 1996 (approval of
non-maintained special schools).

In paragraphs (6) to (8) “the provision of
education services” means a provision of
education, vocational training or board and
lodging falling within Part 3 of Schedule 9
(exceptions).

Paragraphs (6) to (9) are to be read as if
they were contained in the Value Added
Tax Act 1994.

This Resolution comes into force on 30
October 2024 and has effect in relation to
any provision of education, vocational
training or board and lodging on or after 1
January 2025 (whenever that supply is
treated as taking place for the purposes of
the charge to VAT).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have



(46)

statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

35. Stamp duty land tax (additional dwellings:
purchases before 1 April 2025)

That—

(1) Section 1 of the Stamp Duty Land Tax
(Temporary Relief) Act 2023 (which
provides for reduced rates of stamp duty
land tax for transactions before 1 April
2025) is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (3) (which deals with
purchases of additional dwellings), for the
Table A mentioned there substitute—

“TABLE A: RESIDENTIAL

Part of Percentage
relevant
consideration

So much as |5%
does not
exceed

£250,000

So much as [10%
exceeds
£250,000 but
does not

exceed
£925,000




(3)

(4)

(5)

(47)

So much as [15%
exceeds
£925,000 but
does not
exceed
£1,500,000

The 17%”.
remainder (if

any)

The amendment made by this Resolution
has effect in relation to land transactions
the effective date of which falls on or after
31 October 2024 but before 1 April 2025.

But the amendment made by this
Resolution does not have effect in relation
to a land transaction which—

(a) is effected in pursuance of a contract
entered into before 31 October 2024,
and

(b) is not excluded.

For this purpose a land transaction is

excluded if—

(a) there is any variation of the contract,
or assignment of rights under the
contract, on or after 31 October 2024,

(b) the transaction is effected in
consequence of the exercise on or after



(6)

(7)

(48)

that date of any option, right of
pre-emption or similar right, or

on or after that date, there is an
assignment, subsale or other
transaction relating to the whole or part
of the subject-matter of the contract as
a result of which a person other than
the purchaser under the contract
becomes entitled to call for a
conveyance.

In consequence of the provision made by
the preceding paragraphs, the Stamp Duty
Land Tax (Temporary Relief) Act 2020 is
amended as follows.

In section 1 (reduced rates of SDLT in
relation to land transactions the effective
date of which falls in the period beginning
with 8 July 2020 and ending with 30 June
2021)—

(a) in subsection (6) (which provides an

exception from section 44(8) of the
Finance Act 2003 where the contract
is completed after 30 June 2021), for
the words from “that the modifications”
to the end substitute “the reason given
by subsection (6A)”, and

(b) after subsection (6) insert—

“(6A) For this purpose, the sole reason is

either—



(49)

(a) that the modifications made by
this section have no effect in
relation to that conveyance, or

(b) that both paragraph (a) applies
and the increased rates provided
for by Resolution 35 of the House
of Commons (stamp duty land tax
(additional dwellings: purchases
before 1 April 2025)) would have
had effect in relation to that
conveyance.”

(8) In section 1A (reduced rates of SDLT in
relation to land transactions the effective
date of which falls in the period beginning
with 1 July 2021 and ending with 30
September 2021)—

(a) in subsection (5) (which provides an
exception from section 44(8) of the
Finance Act 2003 where the contract
is completed after 30 September 2021),
for the words from “that the
modifications” to the end substitute “the
reason given by subsection (5A)", and

(b) after subsection (5) insert—

“(5A) For this purpose, the sole reason is
either—
(a) that the modifications made by
this section have no effect in
relation to that conveyance, or



(50)

(b) that both paragraph (a) applies
and the increased rates provided
for by Resolution 35 of the House
of Commons (stamp duty land tax
(additional dwellings: purchases
before 1 April 2025)) would have
had effect in relation to that
conveyance.”

(9) In a case where—

(@) as a result of section 44(4) of the
Finance Act 2003 the effective date of
a land transaction is before 31 October
2024, and

(b) the contract concerned is completed by
a conveyance on or after that date,

section 44(8) of that Act is not to apply in
relation to that conveyance if the sole
reason that (but for this paragraph) it would
have applied is that the increased rates
provided for by this Resolution would have
had effect in relation to that conveyance.

(10) Section 44(10) of the Finance Act 2003
applies for the purposes of paragraph (9).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

36. Stamp duty land tax (additional dwellings:
purchases on or after 1 April 2025)



(51)

That provision may be made amending
paragraph 1(2) of Schedule 4ZA to the Finance
Act 2003 so as to increase the rates of stamp
duty land tax mentioned there.

37. Stamp duty land tax (purchases by
companies)
That—
(1) In—
(a) paragraph 3(1)(a) of Schedule 4A to
the Finance Act 2003 (higher rate of
SDLT for purchases by companies etc),
and
(b) step 4 in section 74(1A) of the Finance
Act 2003 (exercise of collective rights
by tenants of flats where condition in
paragraph 3(3) of that Schedule is met),
for “15%” substitute “17%".

(2) The amendments made by this Resolution
have effect in relation to land transactions
the effective date of which falls on or after
31 October 2024.

(3) But the amendments made by this
Resolution do not have effect in relation to
a land transaction which—
(a) is effected in pursuance of a contract
entered into before that date, and
(b) is not excluded.



(4)

(5)

(52)

For this purpose a land transaction is
excluded if—

(a) there is any variation of the contract,
or assignment of rights under the
contract, on or after 31 October 2024,

(b) the transaction is effected in
consequence of the exercise on or after
that date of any option, right of
pre-emption or similar right, or

(c) on or after that date, there is an
assignment, subsale or other
transaction relating to the whole or part
of the subject-matter of the contract as
a result of which a person other than
the purchaser under the contract
becomes entitled to «call for a
conveyance.

In a case where—

(a) as a result of section 44(4) of the
Finance Act 2003 the effective date of
a land transaction is before 31 October
2024, and

(b) the contract concerned is completed by
a conveyance on or after that date,

section 44(8) of that Act is not to apply in
relation to that conveyance if the sole
reason that (but for this paragraph) it would
have applied is that the increased rates
provided for by this Resolution would have
had effect in relation to that conveyance.



(53)

(6) Section 44(10) of the Finance Act 2003
applies for the purposes of paragraph (5).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

38. Annual tax on enveloped dwellings
(alternative finance arrangements)

That provision may be made for the purposes
of annual tax on enveloped dwellings in relation
to land sold to a financial institution and leased
under alternative finance arrangements.

39. Stamp taxes (testing of financial market
infrastructure technologies or practices)

That provision may be made conferring power
on the Treasury to make provision about stamp
duty or stamp duty reserve tax in connection
with regulations made under section 13 of the
Financial Services and Markets Act 2023.

40. Inheritance tax (nil rate band etc for tax
years 2028-29 and 2029-30)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included In Fmance BI||Sg
provision may be made amending section 8
of the Finance Act 2021 so that the nil rate
band, the residential enhancement and the



(54)

taper threshold remain at their current amounts
for the tax years 2028-29 and 2029-30.

41. Inheritance tax (employee benefit trusts)

That provision may be made for the purposes
of inheritance tax in relation to property
becoming subject to a trust for the benefit of
employees.

42. Inheritance tax (agricultural land subject to
environmental management agreement)

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made for treating
land and buildings as agricultural property for
the purposes of agricultural property relief from
inheritance tax where the land is subject to an
agreement entered into with a public authority
for the purpose of protecting, restoring or
enhancing the natural environment, or natural
resources, of land or water.

43. Inheritance tax (statements about national
savings accounts)

That provision may be made revoking
regulation 55 of the National Savings
Regulations 2015 and regulation 90 of the
National Savings (No. 2) Regulations 2015.

44. Rates of alcohol duty



(55)

That—

(1)

N

Part 2 of the Financ

e (No. 2) Act 2023

(alcohol duty) is amended as follows.
(2) For Schedule 7 (main rates) substitute—

“SCHE
Z

DULE

RATES OF ALCOHOL DUTY
TABLE 1

Alcoholic strength
of alcoholic
product

Rate of duty per
litre of alcohol in
the product

Less than 3.5%

£9.61

At least 3.5% but
less than 8.5%

See Table 2

At least 8.5% but
not exceeding 22%

£29.54

Exceeding 22%

£32.79

TABLE 2

Description of
alcoholic product
(of an alcoholic
strength of at least
3.5% but less than
8.5%)

Rate of duty per
litre of alcohol in
the product

a) Still cider

£10.02




(56)

Description of Rate of duty per
alcoholic product | litre of alcohol in
(of an alcoholic the product
strength of at least
3.5% but less than
8.5%)

N

pb) Sparkling cider of
an alcoholic
strength not
exceeding 5.5%

Beer £21.78

N

a) Spirits, wine and|£25.67".
other fermented
products

b) Sparkling cider of
an alcoholic
strength
exceeding 5.5%

N

(3) For Schedule 8 (reduced rates for qualifying
draught products) substitute—



N

(57)

“SCHEDULE

8

QUALIFYING DRAUGHT PRODUCTS:
REDUCED RATES

Description of
alcoholic product

Rate of duty per
litre of alcohol in
the product

Alcoholic products of
an alcoholic strength
of less than 3.5%

£8.28

a) Still cider of an
alcoholic strength
of at least 3.5%

Sparkling cider of
an alcoholic
strength of at
least 3.5% but not
exceeding 5.5%

D)

£8.63

Beer, spirits, wine
and other
fermented
products of an
alcoholic strength
of at least 3.5%
(but less than
8.5%)

b) Sparkling cider of

an alcoholic

£18.76".




streng

(58)

t h

exceeding 5.5%

producer alcoholic products)—
“SCHEDULE

9

(4) For Schedule 9 (duty discount for small

SMALL PRODUCER ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS:
DUTY DISCOUNT

PART 1

ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS, OTHER THAN
QUALIFYING DRAUGHT PRODUCTS, OF AN
ALCOHOLIC STRENGTH OF LESS THAN

8.5%

Alcoholic products, other than spirits,
of an alcoholic strength of less than

3.5%
Discount| Start | End [Marginal| Cumu-
band | thres- | thres- |discount| lative
hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 9.61 -
2 5 50 244 | 48.05
3 50 100 1.47 |157.99
4 100 200 0.49 |231.28




(59)

Alcoholic products, other than spirits,
of an alcoholic strength of less than

3.5%

Discount| Start | End [Marginal| Cumu-
band | thres- | thres- |discount| lative
hold hold (£) |discount

(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
5 200 600 - 280.15
6 600 1000 - 280.15
14 1000 | 4500 | -0.08 |280.15
Spirits of an alcoholic strength of less
than 3.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-

ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount

(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 6.35 -

2 3 50 2.44 31.76
3 50 100 1.47 | 141.70
4 100 200 0.49 | 214.99
3) 200 600 - 263.86
6 600 1000 - 263.86




(60)

Spirits of an alcoholic strength of less

than 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
7 1000 4500 -0.08 | 263.86

Still cider of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%; sparkling cider of an
alcoholic strength of at least 3.5% but
not exceeding 5.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 10.02 -
2 3 50 2.55 50.10
3 50 100 1.53 | 164.78
4 100 200 0.51 | 241.24
3) 200 600 - 292.21
6 600 1000 - 292.21
14 1000 4500 -0.08 | 292.21




(61)

Beer of an alcoholic strength of at least

3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 19.94 -
2 5 112.5 | 11.08 | 99.68
3 | 112.5 225 9.97 [1290.33
4 225 450 5.54 |2411.75
5 450 900 3.32 |3657.77
6 900 1350 - 5153.00
7 1350 4500 -1.64 [5153.00

Wine and other fermented products of
an alcoholic strength of at least 3.5%;
sparkling cider of an alcoholic strength
exceeding 5.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 3) 25.67 -
2 5 50 2.61 128.35




(62)

Wine and other fermented products of
an alcoholic strength of at least 3.5%;
sparkling cider of an alcoholic strength
exceeding 5.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
3 50 100 2.61 | 245.84
4 100 200 1.31 | 376.37
5 200 600 - 506.91
6 600 1000 - 506.91
7 1000 4500 -0.14 | 506.91
Spirits of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 20.89 -
2 5 50 2.61 104.43
3 50 100 2.61 | 221.92
4 100 200 1.31 | 352.46




(63)

Spirits of an alcoholic strength of at

least 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
5 200 600 - 483.00
6 600 1000 - 483.00
7 1000 4500 -0.14 | 483.00
PART 2

QUALIFYING DRAUGHT PRODUCTS OF AN
ALCOHOLIC STRENGTH OF LESS THAN

8.9%

Alcoholic products, other than spirits,
of an alcoholic strength of less than

3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)

1 0 5 8.28 -

2 3 50 2.11 41.40

3 50 100 1.26 | 136.13




(64)

Alcoholic products, other than spirits,
of an alcoholic strength of less than

3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
4 100 200 0.42 | 199.28
5 200 600 - 241.38
6 600 1000 - 241.38
V4 1000 4500 -0.07 | 241.38
Spirits of an alcoholic strength of less
than 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 5.47 -
2 5 50 2.11 27.37
3 50 100 1.26 | 122.09
4 100 200 0.42 | 185.24
5 200 600 - 227.34




(65)

Spirits of an alcoholic strength of less

than 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
6 600 1000 - 227.34
7 1000 4500 -0.06 | 227.34

Still cider of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%; sparkling cider of an
alcoholic strength of at least 3.5% but
not exceeding 5.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 8.63 -
2 3 50 2.20 43.15
3 50 100 1.32 | 141.93
4 100 200 0.44 | 207.78
3) 200 600 - 251.68
6 600 1000 - 251.68
7 1000 4500 -0.07 | 251.68




(66)

Still cider of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%; sparkling cider of an
alcoholic strength of at least 3.5% but
not exceeding 5.5%

Disc-
ount
band

Start
thres-
hold
(hecto-
litres)

End
thres-
hold
(hecto-
litres)

Marginal
discount

(£)

Cumu-
lative
discount

(£)

Beer of an alcoholic strength of at least

3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 ) 1717 -
2 3 112.5 9.54 85.86
3 | 112.5 225 8.59 | 1111.41
4 225 450 4.77 |2077.34
5 450 900 2.86 [3150.59
6 900 1350 - 4438.49
7 1350 4500 -1.41 14438.49




(67)

Wine and other fermented products of
an alcoholic strength of at least 3.5%;
sparkling cider of an alcoholic strength
exceeding 5.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 5 18.76 -
2 ) 50 1.91 93.80
3 50 100 1.91 179.66
4 100 200 0.95 | 275.06
5 200 600 - 370.46
6 600 1000 - 370.46
7 1000 4500 -0.11 | 370.46
Spirits of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%
Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)
1 0 3 15.26 -
2 5 50 1.91 76.32




(68)

Spirits of an alcoholic strength of at
least 3.5%

Disc-| Start End |Marginal| Cumu-
ount| thres- | thres- |discount| lative
band| hold hold (£) |discount
(hecto- | (hecto- (£)
litres) | litres)

3 50 100 1.91 | 162.18
4 100 200 0.95 | 257.58
5 200 600 - 352.98
6 600 1000 - 352.98
7

1000 4500 -0.10 |352.98".

(5) In consequence of the amendments made
by the preceding paragraphs of this
Resolution, in Schedule 2 to the Travellers’
Allowances Order 1994 (which provides in
certain circumstances for a simplified
calculation of excise duty on goods brought
into Great Britain)—

(a) in the entry relating to beer, in the
second column, for “£0.88” substitute
“£0.917,

(b) in the entry relating to still wine, in the
second column, for “£3.28” substitute
“£3.407,



(c)

(d)

(f)

(9)

(h)

(69)

In the entry relating to sparkling wine,
in the second column, for “£3.28"
substitute “£3.407,

In the entry relating to cider, in the
second column, for “£0.44” substitute
“£0.467,

In the entry relating to sparkling cider
of an alcoholic strength not exceeding
5.5% by volume, in the second column,
for “£0.44” substitute “£0.46",

in the entry relating to sparkling cider
of an alcoholic strength exceeding 5.5%
but less than 8.5% by volume, in the
second column, for “£1.73” substitute
“£1.807,

in the entry relating to other fermented
products, in the second column, for
“£3.28” substitute “£3.407, and

in the entry relating to spirits, in the
second column, for “£11.88” substitute
“£12.30°.

(6) The amendments made by this Resolution
come into force on 1 February 2025.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have

statutory

effect under the provisions of the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

45. Abolition of duty stamps for alcoholic

products



(70)

That provision be made repealing section 112
8182a3nd Schedule 12 to, the Finance (No. 2) Act

46. Rates of tobacco products duty
That—

(1) In Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products
Duty Act 1979 (table of rates of tobacco
products duty), for the Table substitute—

“TABLE

1 Cigarettes An amount equal to
the higher of—

(a) 16.5% of
the retail
price plus
£334.58
p e r
thousand
cigarettes,
or

(b) £446.67
P e r
thousand
cigarettes.

2 Cigars £417.33 per
kilogram

3 Hand-rolling £476.83 per
tobacco kilogram




(71)

4 Other smoking £183.49 per
tobacco and kilogram
chewing tobacco

5 Tobacco for £343.91 per
heating kilogram”.

(2) In consequence of the provision made by
paragraph (1), in Schedule 2 to the
Travellers’ Allowances Order 1994 (which
provides in certain circumstances for a
simplified calculation of excise duty on
goods brought into Great Britain)—

(@)
(b)

(c)

(d)
(e)
(f)

in the entry relating to cigarettes, for
‘£422.80” substitute “£446.677,

in the entry relating to hand rolling
tobacco, for “£412.32" substitute
“£476.83",

iIn the entry relating to other smoking
tobacco and chewing tobacco, for
“£173.68” substitute “£183.49”,

in the entry relating to cigars, for
“£395.03” substitute “£417.33",

in the entry relating to cigarillos, for
“£395.03” substitute “£417.33", and

in the entry relating to tobacco for
heating, for “£97.66° substitute
“£103.17".



(72)

(3) The amendments made by this Resolution
come into force at 6pm on 30 October
2024.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

47. Rates of vehicle excise duty

That provision may be made increasing the
rates of vehicle excise duty in Schedule 1 to
the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994.

48. Vehicle excise duty (zero-emission vehicles
etc)

That provision may be made for the purposes
of vehicle excise duty—

(a) aligning the treatment of zero-emission
vehicles with electronically propelled
vehicles, and

(b) treating in specified circumstances an
EU certificate of conformity or UK
approval certificate as specifying a CO,
figure of zero.

49. Rates of HGV road user levy



(73)

That provision may be made increasing the
rates of HGV road user levy.

50. Rates of air passenger duty (current and
future years)

That provision may be made increasing the
rates of air passenger duty, including
(notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the
practice of the House relating to the matters
that may be included in Finance Bills) provision
taking effect in a future year.

51. Rates of climate change levy (future years)

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made taking effect in a future
year increasing the rates of climate change levy.

52. Rates of landfill tax

That provision may be made increasing the
rates of landfill tax.

53. Rate of aggregates levy

That provision may be made increasing the
rate of aggregates levy.

94. Rate of plastic packaging tax



(74)

That provision may be made increasing the
rate of plastic packaging tax.

55. Rates of soft drinks industry levy

That provision may be made increasing the
rates of soft drinks industry levy.

96. Avoidance involving limited liability
partnerships

That—

(1) After section 59A of the Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992 insert—

“89AA Limited liability partnerships:
deemed disposal

(1) This section applies where—

(@) a member of a limited liability
partnership (the “LLP”) contributed
an asset to the LLP in
circumstances where section
59A(1) applied in relation to the
LLP, and

(b) the LLP disposes of the asset, or
part of the asset, to the member,
or a person connected with the
member, in circumstances where
section 59A(1) has ceased to apply
in relation to the LLP.



(75)

(2) The asset is deemed to have been
disposed of and reacquired by the
member—

(a) immediately before it was
contributed to the LLP, and

(b) for a consideration equal to its
market value at that time.

(3) But—
(a) any chargeable gain or allowable
loss accruing under subsection (2)
Is to be treated as accruing at the
time the asset, or part of the asset,

is disposed of by the LLP (as
described in subsection (1)(b)), and

(b) for the purposes of Schedule 2 to
the Finance Act 2019 (returns for
disposals of UK land), the disposal
under subsection (2) is to be
treated as completed at that time.

(4) Any chargeable gain accruing on the
deemed disposal is to be reduced by
an amount that is just and reasonable,
having regard to any chargeable gain
that has otherwise accrued to the
member by reference to the asset or
part of the asset.”

(2) The amendment made by this Resolution
has effect from 30 October 2024 but does
not have effect where section 59A(1) of the
Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992



(76)

ceased to apply in relation to the limited
liability partnership before that date.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the
public interest that this Resolution should have
statutory effect under the provisions of the
Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

57. Loans to participators

That provision may be made repealing section
464B of the Corporation Tax Act 2010.

58. OECD crypto-asset reporting framework

That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary
in the practice of the House relating to the
matters that may be included in Finance Bills)
provision may be made amending section
349(22 of the Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 to add
a reference to the OECD Crypto-Asset
Reporting Framework (published in 2022).

59. Vaping products (preparing for new tax)

That provision may be made conferring power
on the Commissioners for His Majesty’s
Revenue and Customs to prepare for a new
tax relating to vaping products.

60. Carbon border adjustment mechanism
(preparing for new tax etc)

That provision may be made—
(a) conferring power on the Commissioners
for His Majesty’s Revenue and



(77)

Customs to prepare for a new tax
relating to emissions embodied In
imported goods, and

(b) about the disclosure of information for
any purpose connected with the new
tax.

61. Correction of wrong cross-reference etc

That provision may be made correcting errors
in section 1511(1) of the Taxation of Chargeable
Gains Act 1992, section 1179AE(2) of the
Corporation Tax Act 2009 and section 4(2)(a)
816 2’[88 Taxation (Post-transition Period) Act

62. Incidental provision etc

That provision (including provision having
retrospective effect) may be made which is
incidental to, or consequential on or otherwise
connected with, provision authorised by any
other Resolution.



(78)

FINANCE (MONEY): King's recommendation
signified

That, for the purposes of any Act of the
present Session relating to finance, it is

expedient to authorise the payment out of
money provided by Parliament of—

(@)

(b)

any expenditure incurred by the
Commissioners for His Majesty’s
Revenue and Customs which is
attributable to amendments of Part 14A
of the Corporation Tax Act 2009, and

any expenditure incurred by virtue of
the Act by the Secretary of State in
connection with the disclosure of
information for any purpose connected
with a new tax relating to emissions
embodied in imported goods.



