
No. 12

The House met at 2.30 pm.

1	 The Speaker’s Absence

The Clerk at the Table informed the House of the unavoidable absence of the Speaker 
from this day’s sitting.

Dame Eleanor Laing, the Chairman of Ways and Means, proceeded to the Table.

Prayers

2	 Deputy Speaker in the Chair

Dame Eleanor Laing, the Chairman of Ways and Means, took the Chair as Deputy Speaker 
(Standing Order No. 3).

3	 Questions to the Home Secretary

4	 Urgent Question: Israel and Hamas: humanitarian pause (Mr Andrew Mitchell)

5	 Leasehold and Freehold Reform Bill: Presentation (Standing Order No. 57)

Secretary Michael Gove, supported by the Prime Minister, Secretary Oliver Dowden, 
Secretary Lucy Frazer and Lee Rowley presented a Bill to amend the rights of tenants 
under long residential leases to acquire the freeholds of their houses, to extend the 
leases of their houses or flats, and to collectively enfranchise or manage the buildings 
containing their flats, to give such tenants the right to reduce the rent payable under 
their leases to a peppercorn, to regulate charges and costs payable by residential tenants, 
to regulate residential estate management and to regulate rentcharges.

Bill read the first time; to be read a second time tomorrow, and to be printed (Bill 13) 
with Explanatory Notes (Bill 13–EN).

6	 Ways and Means: Rates of tobacco products duty: Adjourned debate on the Question 
proposed on 22 November

Debate resumed (Order, 23 November).

Question again proposed, That—

(1) In Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products Duty Act 1979 (table of rates of tobacco 
products duty), for the Table substitute—

Monday 27 November 2023

Votes and Proceedings



2 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

“TABLE

1 Cigarettes An amount equal to the higher of—

(a) 16.5% of the retail price plus 
£316.70 per thousand cigarettes, or

(b) £422.80 per thousand cigarettes.

2 Cigars £395.03 per kilogram

3 Hand-rolling tobacco £412.32 per kilogram

4 Other smoking tobacco and chewing 
tobacco

£173.68 per kilogram

5 Tobacco for heating £325.53 per kilogram”.

(2) In consequence of the provision made by paragraph (1), in Schedule 2 to the 
Travellers’ Allowances Order 1994 (which provides in certain circumstances for a simplified 
calculation of excise duty on goods brought into Great Britain)—

(a) in the entry relating to cigarettes, for “£393.45” substitute  “£422.80”,

(b) in the entry relating to hand rolling tobacco, for “£351.03” substitute “£412.32”,

(c) in the entry relating to other smoking tobacco and chewing tobacco, for 
“£161.62” substitute “£173.68”,

(d) in the entry relating to cigars, for “£367.61” substitute  “£395.03”,

(e) in the entry relating to cigarillos, for “£367.61” substitute “£395.03”, and

(f) in the entry relating to tobacco for heating, for “£90.88” substitute “£97.66”.

(3) The amendments made by this Resolution come into force at 6 pm on 22 November 
2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

The Speaker resumed the Chair.

The Deputy Speaker announced a time limit on backbench speeches (Standing Order No. 
47(1)).

Question put and agreed to.

Resolved, That—

(1) In Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products Duty Act 1979 (table of rates of tobacco 
products duty), for the Table substitute—

“TABLE

1 Cigarettes An amount equal to the higher of—

(a) 16.5% of the retail price plus 
£316.70 per thousand cigarettes, or

(b) £422.80 per thousand cigarettes.

2 Cigars £395.03 per kilogram

3 Hand-rolling tobacco £412.32 per kilogram

4 Other smoking tobacco and chewing 
tobacco

£173.68 per kilogram



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 3

5 Tobacco for heating £325.53 per kilogram”.

(2) In consequence of the provision made by paragraph (1), in Schedule 2 to the 
Travellers’ Allowances Order 1994 (which provides in certain circumstances for a simplified 
calculation of excise duty on goods brought into Great Britain)—

(a) in the entry relating to cigarettes, for “£393.45” substitute  “£422.80”,

(b) in the entry relating to hand rolling tobacco, for “£351.03” substitute “£412.32”,

(c) in the entry relating to other smoking tobacco and chewing tobacco, for 
“£161.62” substitute “£173.68”,

(d) in the entry relating to cigars, for “£367.61” substitute  “£395.03”,

(e) in the entry relating to cigarillos, for “£367.61” substitute “£395.03”, and

(f) in the entry relating to tobacco for heating, for “£90.88” substitute “£97.66”.

(3) The amendments made by this Resolution come into force at 6 pm on 22 November 
2023.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

7	 Ways and Means: further Resolutions

The Deputy Speaker put forthwith the Questions necessary to dispose of the further 
Motions which were made by the Chancellor of the Exchequer (Standing Order No. 51(3)).

2. Capital allowances (permanent full expensing etc)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made 
amending section 7 of the Finance (No.2) Act 2023 so as to secure that the relief provided 
for in that section extends to expenditure incurred on or after 1 April 2026.

3. Corporation tax (relief for research and development)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision (including 
provision having retrospective effect) may be made about relief from corporation tax 
(including by way of the payment of credits) in respect of expenditure on research and 
development.

4. Corporation tax (films, television programmes and video games)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made for 
the purposes of corporation tax about companies producing films, television programmes 
or video games, including provision for the payment of credits in respect of expenditure 
on the production of those things and provision taking effect in a future year.

5. Corporation tax (relief for theatrical productions)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made—

(a) amending section 1217GB of the Corporation Tax Act 2009, and

(b) amending other provisions of Part 15C of that Act so as to limit or clarify the 
circumstances in which relief under that Part is available.



4 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

6. Corporation tax (relief for orchestral concerts)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made—

(a) amending sections 1217QA and 1217RB of the Corporation Tax Act 2009, and

(b) amending other provisions of Part 15D of that Act so as to limit or clarify the 
circumstances in which relief under that Part is available.

7. Corporation tax (relief for museum and gallery exhibitions)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made—

(a) amending section 1218ZCC of the Corporation Tax Act 2009, and

(b) amending other provisions of Part 15E of that Act so as to limit or clarify the 
circumstances in which relief under that Part is available.

8. Administrative provisions relating to creative reliefs

Resolved, That provision may be made amending Schedule 18 to the Finance Act 1998 in 
relation to claims under any of Parts 15 to 15E of the Corporation Tax Act 2009.

9. Real Estate Investment Trusts

Resolved, That provision (including provision having retrospective effect) may be made 
amending—

(a) sections 528 to 528ZB, 529, 535A, 544, 551, 553 and 606 of the Corporation Tax 
Act 2010, and

(b) section 452 of the Taxation (International and Other Provisions) Act 2010.

10. Tonnage tax

Resolved, That provision may be made—

(a) applying tonnage tax to managers of ships, and

(b) increasing the capital allowances limit for the leasing of ships.

11. Extension of EIS relief and VCT relief

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made for 
EIS relief and VCT relief to be available in relation to shares issued after 5 April 2025.

12. Relief for payments of compensation to companies (Horizon etc)

Resolved, That provision (including provision having retrospective effect) may be made—

(a) for relief from tax in the case of payments of compensation to companies in 
connection with the Horizon computer system used by, and other policies adopted 
by, Post Office Limited, and

(b) conferring a power on the Treasury to provide for relief from tax in other 
cases involving payments of compensation to companies by or on behalf of public 
authorities.

13. Enterprise management incentives (time limits)

Resolved, That provision may be made about the time limits for the giving of notices of 
options and enquiries under Schedule 5 to the Income Tax (Earnings and Pensions) Act 
2003.



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 5

14. Pensions (provision connected with abolition of lifetime allowance charge)

Resolved, That provision may be made in consequence of, or otherwise in connection 
with, the provision made by sections 18, 19 and 23 of the Finance (No.2) Act 2023.

15. Pensions (Members of Parliament etc)

Resolved, That provision may be made in relation to pension schemes for Members of 
Parliament, Members of the Senedd and Members of the Northern Ireland Assembly in 
connection with exercises to be undertaken by those schemes for rectifying discrimination 
in the way in which benefits ceased to be determined by reference to a member’s final 
salary.

16. Income tax (calculation of profits on cash basis)

Resolved, That provision may be made for the purposes of income tax about the 
calculation of the profits of a trade, profession or vocation on the cash basis.

17. PAYE regulations (special types of payer or payee)

Resolved, That provision may be made enabling PAYE regulations to make provision 
(including provision having retrospective effect) in a case where—

(a) a person would otherwise be liable to pay tax in consequence of being treated 
under section 61N(3) of the Income Tax (Earnings and Pensions) Act 2003 as having 
made a payment, and

(b) tax has already been paid or assessed in respect of income referable to that 
payment.

18. Carer’s allowance supplement (correction of reference)

Resolved, That provision (including provision having retrospective effect) may be made 
correcting the reference to the statutory provision in the entry for carer’s allowance 
supplement in Table A in section 660 of the Income Tax (Earnings and Pensions) Act 2003.

19. Stamp duty reserve tax (growth market exemption)

Resolved, That—

(1) Section 99A of the Finance Act 1986 (meaning of “recognised growth market” etc) is 
amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (5)—

(a) in the words before paragraph (a), after “recognised stock exchange” insert “or a 
qualifying UK multilateral trading  facility”;

(b) in paragraph (a), for “£170 million” substitute “£450  million”.

(3) In subsection (6), at the end insert “;

“UK multilateral trading facility” has the meaning given by Article 2.1.14A of 
Regulation (EU) No. 600/2014 of the European Parliament and of the Council of 15 
May 2014 on markets in financial instruments as it forms part of assimilated law.”

(4) After subsection (6) insert—

“(6A)     For the purposes of subsection (5) a UK multilateral trading facility is 
“qualifying” if—

(a) it is operated by an investment firm within the meaning given by article 
3(1) of The Financial Services and Markets Act 2000 (Regulated Activities) Order 
2001 (S.I. 2001/544),  and



6 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

(b) the investment firm has permission under Part 4A of the Financial Services 
and Markets Act 2000 to carry on the regulated activity (within the meaning of 
that Act) of operating a multilateral trading ”

(5) The amendments made by this Resolution come into force on 1 January

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

20. Stamp duty (capital-raising arrangements etc)

Resolved,That the following provisions have effect for the period beginning with the 
day on which this Resolution is passed and ending 31 days after the earliest of the dates 
mentioned in section 50(2) of the Finance Act 1973—

Depositary receipts and clearance services

(1) The Finance Act 1986 is amended as follows.

(2) In section 67 (stamp duty: depositary receipts)—

(a) in the heading, at the end insert “1.5% charge”;

(b) in subsection (1) omit “(other than a bearer instrument)”;

(c) after that subsection insert—

“(1A) For the purposes of subsection (1) “instrument” does not include—

(a) a bearer instrument (see subsection (9A));

(b) an exempt capital-raising instrument (see section 72ZA);

(c) an exempt listing instrument (see section 72ZB).”;

(d) after subsection (9) insert—

“(9ZA) Where an instrument transfers shares in a company which are held by 
the company (whether in accordance with section 724 of the Companies Act 
2006 (treasury shares) or otherwise), subsections (2) to (5) do not apply and 
stamp duty is not chargeable on the instrument.”

(3) In section 69 (depositary receipts: supplementary), in subsection (1), in the words 
before paragraph (a), for “sections 67 and 68 above” substitute “sections 67, 68 and 
72ZB”.

(4) In section 70 (stamp duty: clearance services)—

(a) in the heading, at the end insert “1.5% charge”;

(b) in subsection (1) omit “(other than a bearer instrument)”;

(c) after that subsection insert—

“(1A) For the purposes of subsection (1) “instrument” does not include—

(a) a bearer instrument (see subsection (9A));

(b) an exempt capital-raising instrument (see section 72ZA);

(c) an exempt listing instrument (see section 72ZB).”;

(d) after subsection (9) insert—

“(9ZA) Where an instrument transfers shares in a company which are held by 
the company (whether in accordance with section 724 of the Companies Act 
2006 (treasury shares) or otherwise), subsections (2) to (5) do not apply and 
stamp duty is not chargeable on the instrument.”



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 7

(5) After section 72 (clearance services: supplementary) insert—

“Meaning of “exempt capital-raising instrument” and “exempt listing instrument”

72ZA Meaning of “exempt capital-raising instrument”

(1) For the purposes of sections 67 and 70, an instrument is an “exempt capital-
raising instrument” if the instrument transfers relevant securities in the course of 
capital-raising arrangements.

(2) In this section, “capital-raising arrangements” means arrangements pursuant to 
which relevant securities are issued by a company for the purpose of raising new 
capital.

(3) An instrument is not prevented from being an exempt capital-raising instrument 
by reason only of a delay in transferring relevant securities where

(a) a person (“the transferor”) acquires the relevant securities—

(i) before capital-raising arrangements are entered into, or

(ii) in the course of capital-raising arrangements,

(b) the transferor is subject to a restriction that has the effect of preventing 
the transfer of the relevant securities in the course of the capital-raising 
arrangements, and

(c) the instrument transfers the relevant securities as soon as reasonably 
practicable after the time at which the restriction ceases to have effect.

72ZB Meaning of “exempt listing instrument”

(1) For the purposes of sections 67 and 70, an instrument is an “exempt listing 
instrument” if—

(a) the instrument transfers relevant securities of a company in the course of 
qualifying listing arrangements, and

(b) those arrangements do not affect the beneficial ownership of the relevant 
securities.

(2) In this section, “listing arrangements” means arrangements pursuant to which 
relevant securities, or depositary receipts for relevant securities, are listed on a 
recognised stock exchange.

(3) For the purposes of this section, listing arrangements are “qualifying” if, 
immediately before the first transfer of relevant securities in the course of the 
listing arrangements, no relevant securities in the company or depositary receipts 
for relevant securities in the company are listed on the recognised stock exchange to 
which the listing arrangements relate.

(4) An instrument is not prevented from being an exempt listing instrument by 
reason only of a delay in transferring relevant securities where—

(a) a person (“the transferor”) acquires the relevant securities before qualifying 
listing arrangements are entered into,

(b) the transferor is subject to a restriction that has the effect of preventing 
the transfer of the relevant securities in the course of the qualifying listing 
arrangements, and

(c) the instrument transfers the relevant securities as soon as reasonably 
practicable after the time at which the restriction ceases to have effect.

(5) Section 1005 of the Income Tax Act 2007 (meaning of “recognised stock 
exchange”, “listed” etc) applies in relation to this section as it applies in relation to 
the Income Tax Acts.”



8 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

Bearer instruments

(6) In section 79 of the Finance Act 1986 (stamp duty: loan capital: new provisions), in 
subsection (2)—

(a) omit “on the issue of an instrument which relates to loan capital or”;

(b) for “such an instrument” substitute “an instrument which relates to loan 
capital”.

(7) Section 50 of the Finance Act 1987 (warrants to purchase Government stock etc) is 
amended as follows—

(a) in subsection (2)—

(i) omit paragraph (a);

(ii) in paragraph (b), for “such an instrument” substitute “an instrument which 
relates to an interest, right or option within subsection (1)”.

(b) in subsection (3)—

(i) omit paragraph (b);

(ii) in paragraph (c), for “under that Schedule” substitute “under Schedule 15 to 
the Finance Act 1999 (stamp duty: bearer instruments)”.

(8) Schedule 15 to the Finance Act 1999 (stamp duty: bearer instruments) is amended as 
follows—

(a) omit paragraph 1 (charge on issue of instrument) and the italic heading before it;

(b) in paragraph 2 (charge on transfers of stock by means of instrument), in the 
words before paragraph (a) omit “duty was not chargeable under paragraph 1 on 
the issue of the instrument and”;

(c) in paragraph 4 (1.5% rate of duty) omit “or 6”;

(d) omit paragraph 7 (ascertainment of market value for charge on issue of 
instrument);

(e) in paragraph 17 (exemption for issue of instruments relating to non-sterling 
stock), in sub-paragraph (1)—

(i) in the words before paragraph (a) omit “the issue of”;

(ii) omit the words after paragraph (b);

(f) omit the italic heading before paragraph 21;

(g) omit paragraph 21 (procedure for stamping instruments where duty chargeable 
on issue);

(h) omit paragraph 22 (consequences of default in complying with procedure for 
stamping).

Commencement and transitional provision

(9) The amendments made by this Resolution have effect in relation to instruments 
executed on or after 1 January 2024.

(10) Paragraph (11) applies in relation to securities constituted by or transferable by 
means of an instrument issued before 1 January 2024.

(11) The amendments made by paragraph (7) are to be disregarded.

(12) Paragraph (13) applies in relation to bearer instruments issued before 1 January 
2024—



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 9

(a) in the United Kingdom, or

(b) outside the United Kingdom by or on behalf of a UK company.

(13) The amendment made by paragraph (8)(b) is to be disregarded.

(14) In paragraph (12) “bearer instrument” and “UK company” have the same meaning as 
in Schedule 15 to the Finance Act 1999 (see paragraphs 3 and 11 of that Schedule).

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of section 50 of the Finance Act 1973.

21. Stamp duty reserve tax (capital-raising arrangements etc)

Resolved, That—

Depositary receipts and clearance services

(1) The Finance Act 1986 is amended as follows.

(2) Section 90 (section 87: other exceptions) is amended as follows—

(a) in subsection (3C)—

(i) at the end of paragraph (a) insert “and”;

(ii) omit paragraph (b);

(b) in subsection (3E) omit paragraph (b);

(c) in subsection (4)—

(i) the words from “falling within” to the end become paragraph (a);

(ii) after that paragraph insert “, or

(b) which would fall within section 93(1) or section 96(1) if the 
references in section 93 or section 96 (as the case may be) to the transfer 
of chargeable securities included the issue of chargeable securities.”

(3) In the italic heading before section 93 (SDRT: depositary receipts), at the end insert “: 
depositary receipts”.

(4) In section 93—

(a) in the heading, at the end insert “: 1.5% charge”;

(b) in subsection (1)—

(i) in the words before paragraph (a) omit “Subject to subsection (7) below and 
section 95 below,”;

(ii) in paragraph (b) omit “or issued”;

(c) after that subsection insert—

“(1A) The following provisions contain exceptions to the charge to stamp duty 
reserve tax under this section—

(a) subsection (7) of this section (exception so far as stamp duty is 
chargeable);

(b) section 95 (general exceptions);

(c) section 95A (replacement securities);

(d) section 97AB (exempt capital-raising transfers);

(e) section 97AC (exempt listing transfers);



10 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

(f) section 97AD (exception for transfers of shares held by issuing 
company);

(g) section 97B (transfers between depositary receipt system and 
clearance system).”;

(d) in subsection (4) omit paragraph (a);

(e) omit subsection (10).

(5) In section 94 (depositary receipts: supplementary), in subsection (1), in the words 
before paragraph (a), for “section 93 above” substitute “sections 93 and 97AC”.

(6) In section 95 (depositary receipts: exceptions)—

(a) in subsection (1), in the words after paragraph (b) omit “subject to section 97C,”;

(b) in subsection (2), in the words before paragraph (a) omit “, issue”;

(c) omit subsections (3) to (5);

(d) omit subsection (7).

(7) In section 95A (depositary receipts: exception for replacement securities)—

(a) in subsection (1) omit “, issue”;

(b) in subsection (3)—

(i) in paragraph (a), in the words before sub-paragraph (i) omit “, issue”;

(ii) in paragraph (b) omit “or (3)”;

(c) in subsection (4), in paragraph (a) omit “, issued”.

(8) Before section 96 (SDRT: clearance services) insert—

“Other charges: clearance services”.

(9) In section 96—

(a) in the heading, at the end insert “: 1.5% charge”;

(b) in subsection (1)—

(i) in the words before paragraph (a) omit “Subject to subsection (5) below and 
sections 97 and 97A below,”;

(ii) in paragraph (b) omit “or issued”;

(c) after that subsection insert—

“(1A) The following provisions contain exceptions to the charge to stamp duty 
reserve tax under this section—

(a) subsection (5) of this section (exception so far as stamp duty is 
chargeable);

(b) section 97 (general exceptions);

(c) section 97ZA (exception for replacement securities);

(d) section 97A (election for alternative system of charge);

(e) section 97AB (exempt capital-raising transfers);

(f) section 97AC (exempt listing transfers);

(g) section 97AD (exception for transfers of shares held by issuing 
company);

(h) section 97B (transfers between depositary receipt system and 
clearance system).”;



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 11

(d) in subsection (2) omit paragraph (a);

(e) omit subsection (8).

(10) Section 97 (clearance services: exceptions) is amended as follows—

(a) in subsection (1), in the words after paragraph (b) omit “subject to section 97C,”;

(b) in subsection (3), in the words before paragraph (a) omit “or issue”;

(c) omit subsections (4) to (6).

(11) Section 97AA (clearance services: further exception) is renumbered section 97ZA.

(12) In that section—

(a) in the heading, for “further exception” substitute “exception for replacement 
securities”;

(b) in subsection (1) omit “or issue”;

(c) in subsection (3)—

(i) in paragraph (a), in the words before sub-paragraph (i) omit “or issue”;

(ii) in paragraph (b) omit “or (4)”;

(d) in subsection (4), in paragraph (a) omit “or issued”.

(13) Section 97A (clearance services: election for alternative system of charge) is amended 
as follows—

(a) in subsection (3), in paragraph (a) omit “or issue”;

(b) in subsection (4), in both places omit “, issue”.

(14) After section 97A insert—

“Depositary receipts and clearance services: further exceptions

97AB Exempt capital-raising transfers

(1) There is to be no charge to tax under section 93 or 96 in respect of an 
exempt capital-raising transfer.

(2) For the purposes of subsection (1), a transfer of chargeable securities is 
an “exempt capital-raising transfer” if the transfer is in the course of capital-
raising arrangements.

(3) In this section, “capital-raising arrangements” means arrangements pursuant 
to which chargeable securities are issued by a company for the purpose of 
raising new capital.

(4) A transfer of chargeable securities is not prevented from being an exempt 
capital-raising transfer by reason only of a delay in transferring the chargeable 
securities where—

(a) a person (“the transferor”) acquires the chargeable securities—

(i) before capital-raising arrangements are entered into, or

(ii) in the course of capital-raising arrangements,

(b) the transferor is subject to a restriction that has the effect of 
preventing the transfer of the chargeable securities in the course of the 
capital-raising arrangements, and

(c) the transfer is made as soon as reasonably practicable after the time 
at which the restriction ceases to have effect.



12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

97AC Exempt listing transfers

(1) There is to be no charge to tax under section 93 or 96 in respect of an 
exempt listing transfer.

(2) For the purposes of subsection (1), a transfer of chargeable securities issued 
by a company is an “exempt listing transfer” if—

(a) it is a transfer in the course of qualifying listing arrangements, and

(b) those arrangements do not affect the beneficial ownership of the 
chargeable securities.

(3) In this section, “listing arrangements” means arrangements pursuant to 
which chargeable securities, or depositary receipts for chargeable securities, are 
listed on a recognised stock exchange.

(4) For the purposes of this section, listing arrangements are “qualifying” if, 
immediately before the first transfer of chargeable securities in the course of 
the listing arrangements, no chargeable securities in the company or depositary 
receipts for chargeable securities in the company are listed on the recognised 
stock exchange to which the listing arrangements relate.

(5) A transfer of chargeable securities is not prevented from being an exempt 
listing transfer by reason only of a delay in transferring the chargeable 
securities where—

(a) a person (“the transferor”) acquires the chargeable securities before 
qualifying listing arrangements are entered into,

(b) the transferor is subject to a restriction that has the effect of 
preventing the transfer of the chargeable securities in the course of the 
qualifying listing arrangements, and

(c) the transfer is made as soon as reasonably practicable after the time 
at which the restriction ceases to have effect.

(6) Section 1005 of the Income Tax Act 2007 (meaning of “recognised stock 
exchange”, “listed” etc) applies in relation to this section as it applies in 
relation to the Income Tax Acts.

97AD Exception for transfers of shares held by issuing company

There is to be no charge to tax under section 93 or 96 in respect of a transfer of shares in 
a company which are held by the company (whether in accordance with section 724 of 
the Companies Act 2006 (treasury shares) or otherwise.”

(15) In section 97B (transfer between depositary receipt system and clearance system) 
omit subsection (1A).

(16) Omit section 97C (transfers to non-EU depositary receipt and clearance services 
systems).

(17) In section 99 (interpretation), in subsection (10), in the words before paragraph (a), 
for “97AA” substitute “97ZA”.

Commencement and transitional provision

(18) The amendments made by this resolution have effect in relation to—

(a) agreements to transfer chargeable securities made on or after 1 January 2024;

(b) the transfer or issue of chargeable securities on or after that day.

(19) Paragraph (20) applies in relation to UK bearer instruments within the meaning of 
section 99(1A) of the Finance Act 1986 issued before 1 January 2024.



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 13

(20) The amendments made by paragraph (2)(a) and (b) are to be disregarded.

(21) Paragraph (22) applies for the purposes of section 95A of the Finance Act 1986 
(depositary receipts: exception for replacement securities) where the securities mentioned 
in subsection (3)(a) of that section were issued before 1 January 2024.

(22) The amendments made by paragraphs (3), (4) and (7) are to be disregarded.

(23) Paragraph (24) applies for the purposes of section 97ZA of the Finance Act 1986 
(clearance services: exception for replacement securities) where the securities mentioned 
in subsection (3)(a) of that section were issued before 1 January 2024.

(24) The amendments made by paragraphs (8), (9), (11) and (12) are to be disregarded.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

22. Pillar Two

Resolved, That provision may be made—

(a) for the purpose of ensuring that changes (or anticipated changes) to the Pillar 
Two rules (within the meaning of Part 3 of the Finance (No.2) Act 2023) are taken 
into account in the provision made by Parts 3 and 4 of that Act and otherwise in 
connection with ensuring the consistency of those Parts with those rules, and

(b) about the treatment under those Parts of companies and other entities carrying 
on activities in connection with securitisations or risks associated with insurance

23. Rates of vehicle excise duty (passenger or light goods vehicles, motorcycles etc)

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the rates of vehicle excise duty in Parts 
1 to 2 of Schedule 1 to the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994.

24. Rates of air passenger duty

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the rates of air passenger duty.

25. Hydrocarbon oil duties (rebate on oils used for heating premises)

Resolved, That provision may be made for rebates on oils when used in machines or 
appliances for heating premises.

26. Vehicle excise duty (exemption for foreign vehicles)

Resolved, That provision may be made conferring a power on the Secretary of State to 
make provision (including provision having retrospective effect) for vehicles registered 
outside the United Kingdom to be exempt from vehicle excise duty.

27. Interpreting VAT and excise law

Resolved, That—

(1) This Resolution makes provision about how—

(a) the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018 (“EUWA 2018”), and

(b) the amendments made to that Act by the Retained EU Law (Revocation and 
Reform) Act 2023 (“REULA 2023”), 
are to apply for the purpose of interpreting enactments relating to value added tax 
or any duty of excise (“VAT and excise law”).

(2) Section 4 of EUWA 2018 (retained EU rights, powers, liabilities etc) continues to 
have effect (despite the provision made by section 2 of REULA 2023) for the purpose of 
interpreting VAT and excise law subject to the following exception.



14 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

(3) The exception is that Articles 110 and 111 of the Treaty on the Functioning of the 
European Union (which relate to internal taxation on products) have no effect for that 
purpose.

(4) Section 5(A1) to (A3) of EUWA 2018 (which are inserted by section 3 of REULA 2023 
and which abolish the supremacy of EU law) have effect in relation to VAT and excise 
law as they have effect in relation to other domestic enactments but only so far as 
they relate to the disapplication or quashing of any enactment as a result of EU law 
(and, accordingly, the superseded provisions continue to have effect for the purpose of 
interpreting VAT and excise law).

(5) Retained general principles of EU law—

(a) continue to be relevant (despite the provision made by section 4 of REULA 2023) 
for the purpose of interpreting VAT and excise law in the same way, and to the same 
extent, as they were relevant for that purpose before the coming into force of that 
section, but

(b) otherwise have effect for that purpose subject to the provision made by that 
Act (including, in particular, the amendments made by section 6 of that Act (role of 
courts)).

(6) In this Resolution—

(a) the reference to any duty of excise is to be read in accordance with section 49 of 
the Taxation (Cross-border Trade) Act 2018,

(b) the reference to the superseded provisions is a reference to section 5(1) to (3) 
of EUWA 2018 as those subsections had effect immediately before the passing of 
REULA 2023, and

(c) the reference to retained general principles of EU law is to be read in accordance 
with EUWA 2018 as that Act had effect immediately before the passing of REULA 
2023.

(7) This Resolution needs to be read with sections 42 and 47 of the Taxation (Cross-border 
Trade) Act 2018 (which make other provision about EU law relating to VAT and excise law 
and which continue to have effect for the purpose mentioned in paragraph (1) above).

(8) This Resolution comes into force on 1 January 2024.

And it is declared that it is expedient in the public interest that this Resolution should 
have statutory effect under the provisions of the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act 1968.

28. Rates of landfill tax

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the rates of landfill tax.

29. Rate of aggregates levy

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the rate of aggregates levy.

30. Rate of plastic packaging tax

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the rate of plastic packaging tax.

31. Increasing maximum term of imprisonment for tax offences

Resolved, That provision may be made increasing the maximum term of imprisonment for 
any offence under—

(a) section 106A of the Taxes Management Act 1970 (fraudulent evasion of income 
tax),

(b) section 72 of the Value Added Tax Act 1994 (fraudulent evasion etc of VAT),



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 15

(c) any provision of the customs and excise Acts (within the meaning of the Customs 
and Excise Management Act 1979), or

(d) any other enactment relating to tax.

32. Promoters of tax avoidance (orders disqualifying company directors etc)

Resolved, That provision may be made for officers of Revenue and Customs to apply for 
orders under the Company Directors Disqualification Act 1986 in connection with the 
promotion of schemes and other arrangements involving tax avoidance.

33. Promoters of tax avoidance (stop notices)

Resolved, That provision may be made for cases in which a failure to comply with section 
236B of the Finance Act 2014 constitutes a criminal offence.

34. Construction industry scheme

Resolved, That provision may be made about the conditions for, and the grounds for 
cancelling, gross payment status under the construction industry scheme.

35. Tax returns (information)

Resolved, That (notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the practice of the House 
relating to the matters that may be included in Finance Bills) provision may be made 
taking effect in a future year about—

(a) the information to be provided in returns under the Taxes Management Act 
1970, and

(b) the information to be provided by employers in accordance with PAYE 
regulations.

36. Commencement of provisions relating to penalties

Resolved, That provision may be made about the commencement of Schedules 24 to 27 to 
the Finance Act 2021.

37. Incidental or consequential provision

Resolved, That provision (including provision having retrospective effect) may be made 
which is incidental to, or consequential on, provision authorised by any other Resolution.

Finance: Money

King's Recommendation signified.

Resolved, That, for the purposes of any Act of the present Session relating to finance, it is 
expedient to authorise the payment out of money provided by Parliament of—

(a) any expenditure incurred by the Commissioners for His Majesty’s Revenue and 
Customs in respect of credits to companies in respect of expenditure on research and 
development, and

(b) any expenditure incurred by the Commissioners for His Majesty’s Revenue 
and Customs in respect of credits to companies in respect of expenditure on the 
production of films, television programmes or video games.

8	 Finance Bill

Ordered, That a Bill be brought in upon the foregoing resolutions; That the Chairman of 
Ways and Means, the Prime Minister, the Chancellor of the Exchequer, Laura Trott, Nigel 
Huddleston, Bim Afolami and Gareth Davies present the Bill.

Nigel Huddleston accordingly presented a Bill to make provision in connection with 
finance.



16 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

Bill read the first time; to be read a second time tomorrow, and to be printed (Bill 14), 
with Explanatory Notes (Bill 14–EN).

9	 Statutory Instruments: Motions for Approval

(1) Motion made and Question put forthwith (Standing Order No. 118(6)), That the 
draft Design Right, Artist’s Resale Right and Copyright (Amendment) Regulations 2023, 
which were laid before this House on 16 October, in the last Session of Parliament, be 
approved.—(Aaron Bell.)

Question agreed to.

(2) Motion made and Question put forthwith (Standing Order No. 118(6)), That the draft 
Intellectual Property (Exhaustion of Rights) (Amendment) Regulations 2023, which were 
laid before this House on 16 October, in the last Session of Parliament, be approved.—
(Aaron Bell.)

Question agreed to.

(3) Motion made and Question put forthwith (Standing Order No. 118(6)), That the draft 
Public Service Obligations in Transport Regulations 2023, which were laid before this 
House on 16 October, in the last Session of Parliament, be approved.—(Aaron Bell.)

Question agreed to.

(4) Motion made and Question put forthwith (Standing Order No. 118(6)), That the draft 
Green Gas Support Scheme (Amendment) Regulations 2023, which were laid before this 
House on 16 October, in the last Session of Parliament, be approved.—(Aaron Bell.)

Question agreed to.

(5) Motion made and Question put forthwith (Standing Order No. 118(6)), That the 
draft Health Protection (Coronavirus, Testing Requirements and Standards) (England) 
(Amendment and Transitional Provision) Regulations 2023, which were laid before this 
House on 16 October, in the last Session of Parliament, be approved.—(Aaron Bell.)

Question agreed to.

10	 Business of the House

Ordered, That notices of Amendments, new Clauses and new Schedules to be moved in 
Committee in respect of the National Insurance Contributions (Reduction in Rates) Bill 
may be accepted by the Clerks at the Table before it has been read a second time.—
(Aaron Bell.)

11	 Changes to membership of select committees

(1) Ordered, That Bob Blackman, Kevin Foster, Patricia Gibson, Chris Green, Nigel Mills, 
Wendy Morton and Kate Osborne be members of the Backbench Business Committee.—
(Rebecca Harris, on behalf of the Committee of Selection.)

(2) Ordered, That Paula Barker be discharged from the Home Affairs Committee and Kim 
Johnson be added.—(Rebecca Harris, on behalf of the Committee of Selection.)

(3) Ordered, That Mark Jenkinson be discharged from the Women and Equalities 
Committee and Dr Lisa Cameron be added.—(Rebecca Harris, on behalf of the Committee 
of Selection.)

12	 Adjournment

Subject: Post Office services in Edinburgh West constituency (Christine Jardine)

Resolved, That this House do now adjourn.—(Aaron Bell.) 

Adjourned at 10.26 pm until tomorrow.



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 17

Other Proceedings

*General Committees: Reports

*This item has been corrected since publication. See the Votes and Proceedings relating 
to Wednesday 29 May 2024

13	 First Delegated Legislation Committee

Caroline Nokes (Chair) reported the draft Code of Practice on Reasonable Steps to be 
taken by a Trade Union (Minimum Service Levels).

14	 Second Delegated Legislation Committee

Julie Elliott (Chair) reported the draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: Border Security) 
Regulations 2023.

15	 Third Delegated Legislation Committee

Sir Edward Leigh (Chair) reported the draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: Passenger 
Railway Services) Regulations 2023.

16	 Fourth Delegated Legislation Committee

Dr Rupa Huq (Chair) reported the draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: NHS Ambulance 
Services and the NHS Patient Transport Service) Regulations 2023.

General Committees: Appointments

The Speaker appoints the Chair of General Committees and members of Programming Sub-
Committees, and allocates Statutory Instruments to Delegated Legislation Committees.

The Committee of Selection nominates Members to serve on General Committees (and certain 
Members to serve on Grand Committees).

17	 Second Delegated Legislation Committee (draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: Border 
Security) Regulations 2023)

Members: Anna Firth and Damien Moore discharged and Katherine Fletcher and Joy 
Morrissey nominated in substitution.

18	 Third Delegated Legislation Committee (draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: Passenger 
Railway Services) Regulations 2023)

Members: Liam Byrne, Sir Geoffrey Cox and Dean Russell discharged and Tonia 
Antoniazzi, Andy Carter and Chris Clarkson nominated in substitution.

19	 Fourth Delegated Legislation Committee (draft Strikes (Minimum Service Levels: NHS 
Ambulance Services and the NHS Patient Transport Service) Regulations 2023)

Members: Marsha De Cordova and Sarah Edwards discharged and Richard Burgon and 
Grahame Morris nominated in substitution.

20	 Seventh Delegated Legislation Committee (draft Financial Services and Markets Act 2023 
(Resolution of Central Counterparties: Partial Property Transfers and Safeguarding of 
Protected Arrangements) Regulations 2023, draft Resolution of Central Counterparties 
(Modified Application of Corporate Law and Consequential Amendments) Regulations 



18 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

2023 and draft Payment and Electronic Money Institution Insolvency (Amendment) 
Regulations 2023)

Members: Craig Whittaker discharged and Scott Benton nominated in substitution.

21	 Eleventh Delegated Legislation Committee (draft Retained EU Law (Revocation and 
Reform) Act 2023 (Consequential Amendment) Regulations 2023)

Members: Dehenna Davison discharged and Anna Firth nominated in substitution.

Select Committees: Reports

22	 Defence Committee

*This item has been corrected since publication. See the correction in the Votes and 
Proceedings relating to Wednesday 29 November 2023.

(1) Service accommodation: Oral evidence, to be published (HC 55);

(2) Future aviation capabilities: Written evidence, to be published (HC 51);

(3) Women in the Armed Forces: follow-up: Written evidence, to be published (HC 49)

(Robert Courts).

23	 Levelling Up, Housing and Communities Committee

(1) Council Tax Collection: Second Report, to be printed, with the formal minutes relating 
to the Report (HC 57);

(2) Fire safety: Oral evidence, to be published (HC 62);

(3) Correspondence from the Minister for Levelling Up relating to the Levelling Up Fund: 
Round 3: Written evidence, to be published;

(4) Correspondence with the Permanent Secretary relating to the Committee’s Third 
Special Report of Session 2022–23: Written evidence, to be published;

(5) Correspondence with the Secretary of State: Written evidence, to be published;

(6) Financial distress in local authorities: Written evidence, to be published (HC 56);

(7) Shared ownership: Written evidence, to be published (HC 61)

(Mr Clive Betts).

24	 Public Accounts (Committee of)

(1) Flood defences: Oral and written evidence, to be published (HC 71);

(2) Work of Ofwat: Oral and written evidence, to be published (HC 70);

(3) Correspondence relating to the Committee’s previous Reports: Written evidence, to be 
published

(Dame Meg Hillier).



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 19

25	 Scottish Affairs Committee

(1) Promoting Scotland internationally: Government Response to the Committee’s Eighth 
Report of Session 2022–23: First Special Report, to be printed (HC 274);

(2) Scotland’s space sector: Oral and written evidence, to be published (HC 150);

(3) Correspondence from the Minister for Levelling Up relating to the Levelling Up Fund: 
round 3 allocation: Written evidence, to be published;

(4) Science and Scotland: Written evidence, to be published (HC 151)

(Pete Wishart).

Lindsay Hoyle
Speaker

Westminster Hall

The sitting began at 4.30 pm.

Debate on e-petitions (Standing Orders No. 10(1)(a) and No. 145A(7))

1	 Legislation in respect of dangerous dogs

Resolved, That this House has considered e-petitions 624876 and 643611 relating to 
legislation in respect of dangerous dogs.—(Nick Fletcher.)

Sitting adjourned without Question put (Standing Order No. 10(14)).

Adjourned at 6.57 pm until tomorrow.

Eleanor Laing
Chairman of Ways and Means

Papers Laid

Papers presented and delivered to the Votes and Proceedings Office on Friday 24 
November under Standing Orders No. 158 and No. 159:

Papers subject to Negative Resolution

1	 Road Traffic

(1) Car, Van and Heavy Duty Vehicle Carbon Dioxide Emissions Performance Standards 
(Civil Penalties and Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 1257), 
dated 23 November 2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) 
(Secretary Mark Harper)

(2) Civil Enforcement of Parking Contraventions Designation (No. 2) (West Sussex) 
(Chichester and Crawley) (Amendment) and the Civil Enforcement of Parking 
Contraventions Designation Order 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 1256), dated 20 November 2023 (by 
Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Secretary Mark Harper)



20 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

Papers presented or laid upon the Table on Monday 27 November

Papers subject to Affirmative Resolution

2	 Dangerous Drugs

Draft Misuse of Drugs Act 1971 (Amendment) Order 2024 (by Act), with an Explanatory 
Memorandum and an Impact Assessment (by Command) (Secretary James Cleverly)

3	 Financial Services and Markets

(1) Draft Data Reporting Services Regulations 2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory 
Memorandum (by Command) (Bim Afolami)

(2) Draft Public Offers and Admissions to Trading Regulations 2023 (by Act), with an 
Explanatory Memorandum and an Impact Assessment (by Command) (Bim Afolami)

(3) Draft Securitisation Regulations 2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum and 
an Impact Assessment (by Command) (Bim Afolami)

Papers subject to Negative Resolution

4	 Children and Young Persons

Adoption Support Agencies (England) (Amendment) Regulations 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 
1261), dated 23 November 2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum (by 
Command) (David Johnston)

5	 Financial Services

Short Selling (Notification Threshold) Regulations 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 1258), dated 23 
November 2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum and an Impact Assessment 
(by Command) (Bim Afolami)

6	 National Security

National Security Act 2023 (Consequential Amendments of Subordinate Legislation) 
Regulations 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 1267), dated 27 November 2023 (by Act), with an 
Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Secretary James Cleverly)

7	 Pensions

Occupational Pensions (Revaluation) Order 2023 (SI, 2023, No. 1265), dated 23 November 
2023 (by Act), with an Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Paul Maynard)

8	 Universities of Oxford and Cambridge

(1) Statute, dated 19 June 2023, made by the Chancellor, Masters, and Scholars of the 
University of Cambridge amending the existing Statutes of the University (by Act), with 
an Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Secretary Gillian Keegan)

(2) Statute, dated 19 June 2023, made by the Chancellor, Masters, and Scholars of the 
University of Cambridge amending the existing Statutes of the University (by Act), with 
an Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Secretary Gillian Keegan)

(3) Statute, dated 25 May 2023, made by the Governing Body of Darwin College in the 
University of Cambridge, revising the existing Statutes of the College (by Act), with an 
Explanatory Memorandum (by Command) (Secretary Gillian Keegan)



No. 12 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 21

Other papers

9	 Home

Government Response to the consultation on preventing the use of SIM farms for fraud 
(by Command) (CP 978) (Secretary James Cleverly)

10	 Justice

Murder Sentencing: A consultation on the starting point for determination of the 
minimum term in relation to the mandatory life sentence for murder, for cases preceded 
by controlling or coercive behaviour against the murder victim and cases involving the 
use of a knife or other weapon (by Command) (CP 972) (Secretary Alex Chalk)

11	 National Audit

Report by the Comptroller and Auditor General on Civil service workforce: Recruitment, 
pay and performance management (by Act), to be printed (HC 192) (Clerk of the House)

12	 Public Procurement

Explanatory Memorandum to the Public Procurement (Agreement on Government 
Procurement) (Thresholds) (Amendment) Regulations 2023 (by Command) (Alex Burghart)

13	 Retained EU Law Reform

Explanatory Memorandum to the Draft Employment Rights (Amendment, Revocation and 
Transitional Provision) Regulations 2023 (by Command) (Secretary Kemi Badenoch)

Withdrawn papers

14	 Retained EU Law Reform

Explanatory Memorandum to the Draft Employment Rights (Amendment, Revocation and 
Transitional Provision) Regulations 2023 (laid 7 November 2023)

15	 Public Procurement

Explanatory Memorandum to the Public Procurement (Agreement on Government 
Procurement) (Thresholds) (Amendment) Regulations 2023 (laid 26 October)

 

SPEAKER'S CERTIFICATES

*This item has been corrected since publication. See the correction in the Votes and 
Proceedings relating to Tuesday 28 November 2023.

VOTING BY PROXY (Standing Order No. 39A)

(Variations to existing proxy voting arrangements appear in bold.) 

Member From To Proxy

Mrs Helen Grant 4 September 5 February 2024 Rebecca Harris



22 Votes and Proceedings: 27 November 2023 No. 12

Member From To Proxy

Jane Hunt 4 September 28 November Rebecca Harris

Lucy Allan 27 September 1 February 2024 Rebecca Harris

Dr Kieran Mullan 17 October 19 December Rebecca Harris

Sir David Evennett 8 November 1 January 2024 Rebecca Harris

Ben Everitt 22 November 25 December Rebecca Harris


